COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab
BID NO: RFP 21/05
SUBJECT: Musical Instruments
DATE: 5/11/2020
SCHOOL/DEPT: John Warner MS
[AWARDED TO: See Below in Green
NATIONAL EDUCATIONAL
LOR MUSIC - TT MUSIC - Fort TRUMENT SHOP - Columjl MUSIC CENTER - ColumbilDUCTS COMPANY - Ani§TON MUSIC CENTER - WhgVIUSICAL IMPORT - MinngUSIC & ARTS - Frederick, MK RAIL MUSIC - Santa Barbara| S MUSIC - Berkely Hei MUSIC - Willow GrDNE STAR PERCUSSION - Dallas, ROOK MAYS MUSIC - Dallas MOZINGO MUSIC MUSIC €O - Piscataway,
Item
Dept Brand Model Description Sub | Qty | Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price [ Unit Total | Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price | Unit Total | Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price Unit Total Unit Price | Unit Total
ADAMS BRAND
ADAMS BRAND TOTAL $14,786.00 $16,194.89 No Bid $18,210.00 No Bid $15,070.25 No Bid $15,000.00 $15,705.00 No Bid $15,236.00 $15,947.90 $15,159.00 $17,500.00 $15,520.95
FOX BRAND
Band F B 51 Fox Renard Model 51 Bassoon - N 3
an ox assoon Lacquer Finish ° 4386 13158 | 445129 | 13353.87 4475 13425 4547 13641 4466 13398 4427 13281 4598 13794 No Bid No Bid 4644 13932 4817 14451 4599.4 | 137982
Band F ob 330 Fox Renard Model 330 Oboe - N 2
an e ¢ Lacquer Finish ° 3396 6792 | 344615 | 68923 3465 6930 3520 7040 3425 6850 3427 6854 3560 7120 No Bid No Bid 3595 7190 3727 7454 3560.98 |  7121.96
FOX BRAND TOTAL
o o $19,950.00 $20,246.17 No Bid $20,355.00 No Bid $20,681.00 $20,248.00 $20,135.00 $20,914.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,122.00 $21,905.00 $20,920.16
SHAR BRAND OR EQUAL
SHAR BRAND TOTAL No Bid $18,558.42 $18,240.00 $32,450.00 $35,610.00 No Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO BID id not bid a NO Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
YAMAHA BRAND OR EQUAL
- . Yamaha Clavinova CLP-635
Band Yamaha | Digital Piano CLP-635 Digital Upright Pianowith | "¢ * | Nosid No Bid 1366 1366 1590 1590 No Bid No Bid 2429.99 |  2429.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid
Choir/Orchestra Yamaha | Digital Piano Cvp701 Digital Pianos w/bench —JYes| 2 |, gig No Bid 2088 4176 2500 5000 No Bid No Bid 3599.99 | 7199.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Instructional Yamaha HD-200 Harmony
Band (aty 2) /Orchestra (aty 1)| Yamaha | T\ oy HD-200 Director No| 3] g8 2664 923.08 | 276924 | NoBid 1000 3000 945 2835 No Bid 900 2700 960 2880 No Bid No Bid 909 2727 No Bid 906.3 27189
. Upright Acoustic . o
Choir Yamaha Piano P22 Upright Acoustic Plano w/bench | Yes | 1 |\, gig No Bid 3655 3655 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid
__ Setof 4 (23",26",29",32") -
Band Yamaha | Set of 4 Timpani | YAM-TP4304CL Yamaha standard series | "° | 1 | sass 8488 | 8957.95 | 8957.95 | NoBid 8913 8913 8313.1 8313.1 No Bid 8315 8315 8865 8865 No Bid 8599 8599 | 8821.34 882134 8450 8450 8795.14 | 879514
Yamaha YBB-105WC 3/4 size
Band Yamaha Tuba vBB-105WC three valve Tuba - Lacquer | "° | © | 2685 16110 | 289539 | 1737234 | NoBid 2881 17286 2686.95 | 161217 | NoBid 2687 16122 2860 17160 No Bid No Bid 3127 18762 284276 | 1705656
Band Yamaha Baritone YBS-52 Yamaha YBS-52 Baritone No | 4
an Saxophone Saxophone Lacquer Finish 4149 16596 | 44318 | 177272 | NosBid 4410 17640 4112.75 16451 4156 16624 4114 16456 4375 17500 No Bid No Bid 4797 19188 4351.25 17405
Choir Yamaha | Digital Piano YOP-184  pital Piano Practice Room w/ben| Yes | 1 0 No Bid 1044 1044 1400 1400 1473.7 1473.7 No Bid 1652.4 1652.4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1393 1393 132193 | 132193
. Yamaha YEP-321 4 valve
Band Yamaha|  Euphonium | YEP-321-Lacquer | o iim - Lacquer Finish | "0 | | 1733 13864 | 1838.98 | 14711.84 | NoBid 1830 14640 1706.6 13652.8 1748 13984 1707 13656 1815 14520 No Bid No Bid 1981 15848 1805.55 | 144444
Band Yamaha | Tenor Saxophone | YTS-480 - Lacquer s Yamhaha YTfASO Te';."f h No | 4
axophone - Lacquer Finis 1995 7980 2120 8480 No Bid 2110 8440 1967.4 7869.6 2014 8056 1964 7856 2095 8380 No Bid No Bid 2287 9148 2081.47 | 8325.88
AWARD BY ITEM:
Conn CONNstellation 8D
Double French " .
Band Conn H 8D Double Horn, Nickel Silver No| 2
o Finish, Fixed Bell 3515 7030 | 377238 | 754476 | Nobld 3754 7508 No Bid 351165 | 70233 3458 6916 3512 7024 3655 7310 No Bid No Bid NO Bid 3568 7136 No Bid 3703.82 | 7407.64
Portable PiaNo with stand and
Band Kerzweil | SP6 Stage Bundle | SP6-8StgBn |case (Kurzweil SP6 Stage Bundle| No | 1
- Kurzweil SP6 Stage Piano, No Bid No Bid No bld 1225 1225 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
King 2341W Full Size Four Val
Band King Tuba 2341W-Lacquer ng Tuba - L Y size F.oyrh ave No| 3
uba - tacquer Finis 5290 15870 | 5574.28 | 16722.84 | Nobld 5546 16638 No Bid 5189 15567 5190 15570 5395 16185 No Bid No Bid NO Bid 5272 15816 No Bid 5472.96 | 16418.88
Band Musser Concert Bells M645 Musser 2.5 ?&‘:Z:'CIBSS‘C Bells No| 1
1044 1044 | 108257 | 108257 | Nobld 1078 1078 No Bid 1007.75 | 1007.75 958 958 1050 1050 No Bid 1076 1076 | 1066.06 1066.06 1024 1024 No Bid 1062.89 | 1062.89
Concert Bass 36x16 Pearl Concert Bass Drum
Band Pearl Drum With PEA-PBE3616/F46 | with STBDF36 Field Suspended | No [ 1
Suspended Field Stand 1311 1311 14359 | 14359 No bld 1785 1785 No Bid 13313 13313 1344 1344 1390 1390 No Bid 1351 1351 1414 1414 1344 1344 1548 1548 1385 1385
Band Vito | Bass Clarinet 7168 Vito 7168LL°W Eb:a,sshaa”"ﬁ ol 2
acquer Finis 1616 3232 173851 | 3477.02 No bld 1730 3460 No Bid 1618.35 3236.7 1642 3284 1619 3238 NO BID No Bid No Bid NO Bid 1645 3290 No Bid 170691 | 3413.82




